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• 2nd Grade hosted Mass today:  Our school families are always invited and encouraged to attend.  

• Ash Wednesday:  Next Wednesday is Ash Wednesday.  Mass times are 6:30 am, 9:00 am, 12:00 noon,  6:00 pm 
Liturgy of the Word and 8:00 pm Spanish Mass.  We will begin our Lenten journey of fasting, almsgiving, and acts 
of good deeds.  Only cheese pizza is served on Fridays during Lent.  Instead of doing Rice Bowls this year, we will 
collect change as we have in the past and give our sacrifices to Help 4 Kids, keeping our almsgiving local.    

• Children’s Mass:  Cantus Angelicus will sing this Sunday at 9:15 am.  The Women’s Club will host hospitality in the 
cafeteria immediately following Mass.   

• Raving Fan Marketing Plan:  You are our best advocates!  During this season of enrollment, we challenge each 
child and parent to share something they love about St. Andrew with a fellow colleague, friend, or family member.  
We are sending home business cards with the students today to hand out to friends.  Their task is to write their 
name on the back of the card, give the card to a friend, and tell that person why they love St. Andrew.  If that friend 
comes into school with the business card, we will enter it into a SWAG drawing.  So please, have fun handing out 
your cards and bragging about your school! 

• Open House:  Our school will host Open Houses tomorrow, Feb. 20 and Tuesday, March 3 from 9-2pm.  Please 
encourage friends and family to come visit our beautiful school! 

• Advisory Board Meeting:  Tuesday, Feb. 25th at 5:00 pm in the Library. 

• Shakespeare Showcase:  8th graders will entertain us with the annual Shakespeare Showcase next Tuesday, 
February 25th under the direction of Ms. Sauvageau.  Showtimes are 1:00pm and 1:45pm in our cafeteria.   

• 1st Communion attire coupons:  2nd grade students will find coupons from Foxy Lady in their folders today.  Foxy 
Lady is located at 4101 N. Kings Hwy. and sells First Communion dresses and accessories. 

• Lip Sync:  Mark your calendars for our annual Lip Sync contest on Friday, April 24th, 7:00 pm in our gym!  The 
students will practice in the gym on the 22nd after lunch.  All proceeds benefit our PE Department.  This year we 
are looking at buying new Volleyball uniforms, replacing balls for recesses, and other fun PE needs. If your group 
would like to sign up email Coach Rollings at trolllings@standrewschoolmb.org   

• Basketball News:  Come support your Crusaders tonight at our annual Grand Strand Middle School League 
Basketball Tournament.  Our girls play at 5:00 pm at St. Michaels this evening and our Sr. Boys at home at 5:00 pm.   

• DOCYBT:  The Diocese of Charleston Youth Basketball Tournament is in Charleston this weekend.  Players may 
leave at lunch recess on Friday, Feb. 21 (be sure to send in a note if leaving with someone else).  Good luck to all 
our teams and we pray everyone stays safe. 

•  Help4Kids Friday, February 28: This month we are collecting toothbrushes, toothpaste and other hygiene 
supplies.  Thank you for your generosity! 

"Totally love Him, Who gave Himself  totally for your love." 
— St. Clare of  Assisi 
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